Forwarded message
From: Francis Santos <fesantos57@amail.com>

Date: Sat, Mar 26, 2011 at 10:31 AM

Subject: Re: Funding for New High School

To: tmtaitano@agdoe.net

Cc: Taling M Taitano <tmt1@gadoe.net>, Vincent Leon Guerrero <vincent.leonguerrero@quam.gov>, Nerissa Bretania
Underwood <nbunderwood@adoe.net>, Arlene Unpingco <arunpingco@gdoe.net>

Taling,
Please prepare a detalied worksheet:

Staffing Requirements - Teaching and non-teaching
Collateral Equipment - please be as detailed as possible
Contractual - please provide the details

Text Books

Is GDOE paying for the utilities?

Is the Landlord paying for maintenance or GDOE?

Is this Dining Facility outsourced?

Francis

On Fri, Mar 25, 2011 at 3:51 PM, Taling M Taitano <tmt1@adoe.net> wrote:
The $2.8 is the incremental cost for the additional support staff and contractual support for the school for 2012 the fiscal
year. | will ask Kris to come up with more definitive numbers for what is needed for the opening of school.

On Fri, Mar 25, 2011 at 3:05 PM, Vincent Leon Guerrero <vincent.leonquerrero@guam.gov> wrote:

| think we need to meet as soon as possible on this matter. Let me know what works for everyone-send out a couple
dates and times that are good for you.




